Automotive Supplies #400 Baldwinsville Schools
April 26, 2024 at 2:00 PM Baldwinsville, NY 13027
Part 2

Part 2 is for emergency, over the counter, purchases of items not listed on Part 1. These purchases will be made
throughout the school year as needed by the District. The list below is only for calculating bottom line cost of items
listed. IT IS NOT A REPRESENTATION OF ITEMS THAT WILL BE ORDERED AND ANY DISCOUNT OFFERED

IS TO BE APPLICABLE TO ALL PURCHASES IN CATEGORY INDICATED, THROUGHOUT THE YEAR EXCLUDING
ANY EXCLUSIONS LISTED BELOW.

[YOU MUST BID ON AT LEAST 75% OF ITEMS (OR 26 OF 35)

**You are to fill in CATALOG LIST PRICE of each item and indicate percent of discount.**

Award will be made to the bidder offering the lowest price AFTER DISCOUNT on items specified. The percentage
indicated will be offered until June 30, 2024, or when a new contract is awarded, whichever is earlier. Any such decision
by the School District shall be final and conclusive. You must provide product line information that the discount is to be
taken from and must be able to show List Price upon request.

Please indicate items (if any) excluded from the discount.

You must indi BRAND AND # offered where specified. O'Reilly Auto Parts New York Bus Sales, LLC. Leonard Bus Sales, Inc. United Auto
Item
| # | Description Unit LIST Price | Discount | TOTAL LIST Price | Discount | TOTAL LIST Price | Discount TOTAL LIST Price | Discount | TOTAL
Bulbs:
1 [1157- Wagner ea 1.41 LL 41%+ 0.23 0.62 | 25.93% off list 0.46 0.34 27% 0.25 1.15 80% 0.23
2 [1156 - Wagner ea 1.41 LL 41%+ 0.39 0.51 | entire group 0.38 0.43 21% 0.31 1.25 80% 0.25
3 [93-Wagner ea 0.68 LL 41%+ 0.29 0.77 0.57 0.36 27% 0.26 2.85 80% 0.57
4 |194-Wagner ea 1.41 LL 41%+ 0.21 0.49 0.36 0.32 21% 0.23 0.85 80% 0.17
5 [94-Bulb ea 1.30 LL 41%+ 0.56 6.74 4.99 0.39 27% 0.28 3.65 80% 0.73
6 | 194-Bulb ea 1.41 LL 41%+ 0.21 0.49 0.36 0.32 21% 0.23 0.85 80% 0.17
7 | T1004-Bulbs ea No Bid 16.05 11.89 0.43 27% 0.31 2.50 80% 0.50
8 |90-Bulbs ea 0.73 LL 41%+ 0.31 0.57 0.42 0.37 27% 0.27 1.85 80% 0.37
9 | 1076 Bulb ea 0.76 LL 41%+ 0.33 0.82 0.61 0.41 21% 0.30 4.35 80% 0.87
10 | 1003 Bulb ea 1.49 LL 41%+ 0.36 0.66 0.49 0.41 27% 0.30 225 80% 0.45
11 | 313 Bulb ea LL 41%+ | No Bid 0.84 0.62 0.82 21% 0.60 2.15 80% 0.43
12 | 3157NA Bulb ea 1.98 0.82 2.15 1.59 1.77 27% 1.29 4.90 80% 0.98
13 | 194NA Bulb ea 1.44 LL 41%+ 0.54 0.62 0.46 0.84 27% 0.61 215 80% 0.43
14 | 1004 Bulb ea 1.49 LL 41%+ 0.36 0.66 0.49 0.43 27% 0.31 2.50 80% 0.50
15 | 906 Bulb ea 27.10 LL 41%+ 5.50 0.70 0.52 0.52 27% 0.38 2.60 80% 0.52
16 | 912 Bulb ea 1.41 LL 41%+ 0.42 0.70 0.52 0.52 21% 0.38 2.50 80% 0.50
Headlight Product Specific: Wagner
[ 17 ] 9007 Headlight - High/Low | ea $ 27.10 | LL41%+[$ 550 | § 3.63 | 25.93% off list]| $ 269 | $ 5.02 | 27%] $ 366 | $ 15.75 | 80%| $ 3.15
|18 | Halogen Bulb BP1255/H3 | ea $ 15.58 | LL41%+|$ 295§ 1.94 | entire group | $ 144 [ § 556 | 27%| $ 406 | $  13.75 | 80%| $ 275
Butt C. Y
[ 19 T16-14 | ea $ 1.18 | LL41%+[$ 070§ 0.24 [25.93% offlist] $ 0.18 | No Bid | | $ 040 | 80%[ $ 0.08
| 20 [22-18 | ea $ 1.18 | LL41%+[$ 070 [§ 0.20 | entire group | $ 0.15 | No Bid | | $ 0.40 | 80%| $ 0.08
Heater Hose:
21 | 1" - Silicone Hose 25' $ 1,652.12 LL41%+| $ 605.00 493.09 |25.93% off list 365.25 | No Bid 1,878.95 80% 375.79
22 | 1/2" - Silicone Hose 25' LL 41%+ | No Bid 285.53 | entire group 211.50 | No Bid 1,046.15 80% 209.23
23 | 3/4" - Silicone Hose 25' $ 1,355.51 LL41%+| $§ 482.00 408.04 302.25 | No Bid 1,437.55 80% 287.51
Air Lines: Midland Air Lines:
24 116322 ea No Bid 16.77 [25.93% off list 12.42 26.77 42% 15.53
25 (16324 ea $ 49.14 LL41%+| $§ 1879 18.37 | entire group 13.61 27.06 42% 15.69
26 | 16328 ea $ 49.14 LL41%+| $  19.24 20.09 14.88 28.63 42% 16.61
Item 4 Description Unit
Filters: Napa: Equal to Napa - No Generic Filters
27 (1799 ea 96.59 LL 41%+ 28.31 34.07 |25.93% off list 25.24 61.31 64% 22.07 96.75 80% 19.35
28 | 1522 Qil Filter ea 22.02 LL 41%+ 5.29 6.43 | entire group 4.76 15.81 64% 5.69 17.35 80% 3.47
29 1100255 Oil Filter ea 22.02 LL 41%+ 5.29 6.43 4.76 13.38 64% 4.82 17.35 80% 3.47
30 | 7060 Filters ea 22.02 LL 41%+ 5.29 6.43 4.76 12.67 64% 4.56 17.35 80% 3.47
31 | 7708 Oil Filter ea 176.25 LL 41%+ 50.45 60.78 45.02 162.75 64% 58.59 172.40 80% 34.48
32 | 7744XD Qil filter ea 162.69 LL 41%+ 45.71 54.45 4.33 99.88 64% 35.96 156.20 80% 31.24
33 | 7045 OQil Filter ea 22.02 LL 41%+ 5.29 6.43 4.76 13.69 64% 4.93 17.35 80% 3.47
34 1372 QOil Filter ea 22.02 LL 41%+ 5.29 6.43 4.76 16.93 64% 6.09 17.35 80% 3.47
35 | 1042 Qil Filter ea 22.02 LL 41%+ 5.29 6.43 4.76 19.69 64% 7.09 17.35 80% 3.47
TOTAL $1,301.62 TOTAL $ 1,052.25 TOTAL $ 211.66 TOTAL $ 992.15
Discount is offered through (date): 4/30/2027 June 30, 2025 6/30/2025

For most items in stock, Stock replenishment
Delivery within 2 hours after call is made? |shipments 5 nights a week Yes Yes




